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Minutes of the RWM 2759 held at

the Mahendra Smriti Sabhaghar
RC Dumdum on 26.10.24 at 6.30 pm

DISCUSSION:
a) With the permission of the Chair,
PP Rtn. K B Ghosh initiated a
discussion regarding the
Community Centre premises at
Khudiram Colony, emphasizing the
immediate need for the erection of
a boundary wall.
To move the proposal forward, the
President requested Rtn. Sekhar
Chaterjee to prepare an estimate
for the construction of the
boundary wall for necessary
decision by the board.

b) Upon request, PP Rtn. Dr. Prabir
Kumar Saha spoke about the
importance of crop selection for
gainful agriculture, particularly with
respect to their genetic aspects.
Members appreciated his
presentation and the practical
implications discussed.
c) With the Chair's permission, Club
Service Chair, PP Rtn. Dr. Asoke
Das proposed to celebrate the Club
Bijoya-Diwali Meet at Outram Club,
Kolkata on Saturday,

November 16th. He presented a
tentative budget of ₹45K for the
event.

ENDING:
The minutes of RWM 2758,
circulated via email and WhatsApp,
were confirmed by the 14 members
present at the meeting. Sunshine
was collected through billing. The
President concluded the meeting
with advance Diwali greetings and
expressed hopes to see all
members at the next RWM on
Friday, November 8th.

ADDRESS:
President Rtn. Sanjib Roy called the
meeting to order, warmly
welcoming all members in
attendance.

BEGINNING:
The meeting commenced with the
National Anthem, led by Rtn. Dr.
Purnendu Biswas at the request of
the President.

CLUB BUSINESS:
The Secretary, Rtn. Chinmay Roy,
conducted the club business:
a) Early birthday wishes were
extended to Rtn. Chumki Sengupta,
whose birthday is on October 31st,
with all members joining in the
celebration.
b) Announcement of the receipt of
the newsletter "CHAKA" from RC
Calcutta.
c) The President declared that there
would be Kalipuja and Diwali
celebrations on November 1st, and
as a result, there will be no RWM
on that day.
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